


I am now famous in the whole world.


It worked! 

(I need half of an almond)


Naturally it worked. Because all is destiny and subconscious convictions in 
alignment with that or not. All from the answered call. No matter how far that 
was from where I am now. Intuitive guidance. The voice of love. The voice of life.


When you become true and rid yourself of resistance you believe yourself a great 
deal. So the impressions will have a stronger effect the further you come in your 
self realization and development. To sit in a one room apartment making your 
first beat stating: ’I am famous in the whole world’ feels far away. Almost 
impossible. But there it is! Almost! ..So yer telling me there’s a chance…!


Yes there is. Always.


So it’s simply just stating this and it will happen?


Well..No.


You have to transform. Which includes creation. And affirmations. And mental 
strength. Emotional rollercoaster. And learning a lot about what is what in 
relation to a general state of feeling.


What do you really want? What is calling you? Some might think that my calling 
is to become world famous and release music. That is true but it’s a part of it all. 
My initial calling and the root core of my destiny has always been about truth. To 
unveil the lie which is all about making the world a better place. I beleive all 
great artists are about that but get’s tangled up in Ego along the way. So in my 
calculations and perspective I wanted to make everything clear before any fame. 
So the core intention would remain in light as much as possible and not drift 
away in my stardom or whatever.


I really like conversations and connection in love. To talk and experience more 
together. To share life and help each other out. And I love making music. Not 
necessarily affirmation music like I’ve done recently. I did those for myself and 
also for you. I would like to create some more music that I love. So I wanna help 
out, I love music & I love love. I love myself. And I love you. I love and 



appreciate everything and I see the positive in everything. I see the love even in 
perceived darkness. I am a positive guy. I want all to be friends.


I wanna receive it all so I can use most of it helping others. I feel worthy of 
receiving and to have in my possession things that makes my life easier and more 
comfortable. I love to eat great food! And I am always interested and passionate 
about trying new things.


If you read all that without any personal connection to me. Just abstract like any 
guy. Would you say that this person is a good person? Would you say God, 
Source whatever surely would favor this person and give them more resources?

Would you feel that connections surely would happen as to put this individual in 
places where they can be a light for others?


I would. Sounds like a really terrific guy! Super kind and fun loving. Music and 
food! Wants to give more than he owns. Has given all he got for the last 6-7 
years, 7 days a week, day and night and almost killed himself for love.


I’d book that guy! I’d hire that guy! I would give him more as he deserves to 
receive what he needs as to become more of what he is.


But know this..


None. I mean none. Is possible. Without me telling myself that.


I can’t sit around and wait for the world to acknowledge me and my art. And 
cannot sit around feeling like a failure and that nobody’s interested in me. I 
cannot sit around and feel sorry for myself as in not receiving anything good.


I AM!


GOOD ENOUGH! I AM BEAUTIFUL! I AM KIND! I AM WORHTY! I AM 
FANTASTIC! I AM WONDERFUL! I AM LOVE! I AM RICH! I AM FREE!


Self creator! Independent! Standing strong on my two feet! My feet of gold!

I cherish and love myself! I appreciate everything about my body! I have a 
wonderful imagination! I am so grateful and thank God for who I am!


That’s the success.

What you want wants you.. Many have probably heard that one.




That’s union. You connecting with you within. In truth. In loyalty.


Clearing your subconscious from anything and everything speaking against you.


All of the bullying and lack of support was all jealousy and fear. Fear inside 
others to become true and pursue their destiny. Making excuses like they don’t 
need that kind of attention. Who does not want to be appreciated and loved 
around the world??? That’s beautiful! And going hand in hand with helping 
others to feel a lot of love in relation to themselves is gorgeous!


We all know deep inside what is true.

We all know deep inside what it demands of us to pursue our destiny.

We all know inside our soul being that we cannot bullshit if we wanna make it.


So most continue to bullshit.

And complain..


But also! Talk shit about people going for it! Wanting to bring them down. But 
that is all fear. That’s all bringing them down to their low level of expectancy in 
relation to all that bullshit and complaining.


What you affirm about yourself has to go hand in hand with a positive 
expectancy! Or else you hurt the baby dream. Do you have to be ecstatic? Nah..


That will require vast amounts of energy. So just a slight smile and feeling grateful 
for everything that you know will happen. Whatever that is and whenever that 
happens. Just do everything in advance. You gotta feel for it before it happens..


And that is hard with a lot of resistance. So clear that as well.. By freeing and not 
condemning. Understanding as to forgive and release..


And your heart will naturally come to peace and joy. A pure heart attracts 
effortlessly. And listens to you as you are loyal to love. It’s all connected. The 
subconscious convictions. The Ego controlling or working for you. The tensions in 
the body. The relaxation and the breathing. You are like a planet yourself! All of 
what is happening in your life is a bunch of deaths and births felt by your system.


So get to know it. Don’t act like it’s not a part of you. And don’t ask somebody 
else what’s going on with you? All is truth or lie. Truth is relaxation. Lie is tension. 
Relaxation makes blood flow = Healthy. Tension makes for hindrance of blood 
flow, restriction. Contraction. = Disease. Which originally is all about feeling 



uncomfortable. And that is something you can consume something to soothe and 
get rid of or you can deal with it. As to free yourself.


There is nothing wrong with you.


You come from where you come from in regards to social interactions, trauma, 
misconceptions etc. And those are all a part of you wanting to sort them out. For 
yourself and your entire family. That’s the root core cause of all uncomfortable 
experiences. You wanna make it right and free everyone thus making all live in 
peace and joy having a wonderful life together all in pleasure of greatest 
morality. Bam!


ADHD. ADD. Tourettes. Etc etc etc.. (Don’t give love a bad name)


EXPRESSION! CREATION! MISUNDERSTANDING! CONFUSION! WANNA 
KNOW! FEELS THE TRUTH! WANNA UNVEIL THE LIE! MAKE IT RIGHT! COME 
TOGETHER! FEEL FREE! AND ALSO SAFE! HAVING FUN!!! ALL IN JOY!


So.. We hide then? We be quiet? We take pills? We drink a lot of alcohol? We 
don’t create? We don’t interact? We don’t share? We watch TV and don’t care?


FUCKIN’ EY NO! NAH! FUCK NO!


We do what I did! In relation to ourselves. We don’t have to make a website 
longer than the internet itself. We don’t have to make affirmation music all day 
long! But WE KEEP IT REAL! Honest to God! Truth be told and behold! Loyal to 
love! Working for love! Affirming love! Acknowledging love! PRAISING LOVE!!!!!


And everything will change. Not only for the better. But for the SPECTACULAR!!!


If you ain’t got you vision of dreams working than you aren’t able to imagine shit. 
Are you using your imagination at all? It’s meant to be used. By you. It wants you 
to use it for good as it will make you feel good and that makes you create good 
which does good and the world becomes good. You see how you affect 
everything and create the world.


Let these words hype you but keep the peace and good vibe. No need to be 
hyper. Just hyped! You feel me? And use the energy inside you to create and to 



understand more. Creating more and more positive things. Come together if you 
feel lost and talk amongst each other. What can we do as to connect more and 
make this world more loving?


Instead of watching series on streaming services for 6 hours wasting your life.


I made it! And I made it because I worked at it! I sacrificed myself so much I 
almost did NOT make it. As this is my destiny. I am the trigger on the gun that 
fires a rose all over the world! Because it was time. And I was the one to do it.


Because I am.


I consider myself just as worthy as you. I am on the same level of worthy as you.


But as for right now. I am on a totally different level spiritually.


And the weird thing about that is that it has become less and less. Some might 
think it has to be add-ons. Additive. But it actually subtractive. You loose a lot of 
shit on the way making the simplistic foundation of the universe so clear.


So the game is not to store a bunch of information like the school systems claim 
we need. It’s actually to clear space for emotional understanding and new 
creations. How the hell do you expect innovation without any room for it.


And with all this high speed stressed out society we kill ourselves.


Nature provides all we need. If you are a religious individual whom hasn’t 
smokes weed or had psilocybin mushrooms you have no faith. You don’t believe 
in God. As God is nature and nature is God.


- I am not doing drugs!


Do you take aspirin for headaches? I don’t. I don’t do drugs.


Can you see how your poor judgement and small mind is in total misconception 
of all because you do not think and feel for yourself?


That’s the big problem with religion.


People not engaging and participating in actually relating as to understand and 
free. To trust nature and to know that nature is God. Yet talking about this Jesus 
dude all the time who’s gonna make everything alright when he returns…




That’s retarded. For real.


Get your head out the sand!


Open your mind just a little bit. And you will see the truth.


Just as that Jesus dude was talking about and in the Bible is as of now a 
metaphor for you being true to yourself. That’s the message. It has always been 
that. You are God experiencing itself. The universe. Source.. Whatever.


Jesus saves!


Yes. That is true. Truth saves. And when you call upon Jesus you call upon truth. 
Using a metaphor to make it comprehensive in your own imaginative world. It’s a 
vehicle. That’s why you can change that into whatever as multiple religions make 
it work. Because it doesn’t matter. You don’t owe Jesus Shit!


If Jesus would return somehow he would smack you in the face and ask if another 
2000 years is necessary for you in learning what he taught back at the 
beginning. We are the same! He would scream in your face in frustration. There 
is no difference between us! I am no greater than you. I just do what is expected 
of me in relation to my specific destiny working for love.


But he won’t. He’s dead.

Dead bodies don’t come back.


But consciousness does.


Man this has been a tough job..


I am surprised I am alive! I am surprised my body hasn’t crucified itself by now.


I AM : World Famous


You know why?


Because all of ya’ll need it. As in right now.


Home is not far far away..


Home is right where you are.




Look at the FUCKIN’ ICONS! (I ain’t mad.. I laugh as I write this actually)


He has an open chest displaying his heart pointing at it with a soft expression.


Then they did that into a victim with thorns and constant crying and shit..


Life ain’t about that.


That’s EXACTLY like a little kid sitting on the floor crying themselves to a brand 
new PlayStation of whatever. WRONG. BUZZER! EEIEEE!!!


You get what you give.


Give love. Get love. (Know love)


I am famous in the whole world. I am famous in the whole world. I am famous in 
the whole world. I am famous in the whole world! I am famous in the whole 
world! .. I just felt like writing it multiple times because it feels so good in my 
heart. And I ain’t wearing thorns and crying in agony as I write it! Hell nah..


I am happy!


I made myself!


That’s how I made it!


From the shittiest shit of lies background. With my whole family against me! 
Errbody hurting me and leaving me to die. But I rose up! Like a fuckin’ Phoenix!


Not like Finch! (Cloud Atlas)


But as ’The Rose’! Leo Rosenblad! Protector! Truth teller! Love Lover! Man of 
God! FOR REAL! I do not critique myself! I celebrate myself as I am Love!


What’s the difference between you and me? For real..


None.




We are the same. I am unique. You are unique.


I got for it. You can do that to!


And I can help out. I can teach the ways of self creation. Many others can as 
well. And we grow together. As one family. One world of love. In spirit. In love.


Religion can be beautiful. But it’s mostly about control and submission.


To favor someone over someone else. That’s completely contrary to a world of 
love. The feminine has been shaded greatly. And that’s the power of love. Which 
isn’t female.


I AM NOW WORLD FAMOUS!


Ain’t nothing wrong with that!


Sop being jealous and make excuses.


You don’t have to become world famous but I did all of this as a really really 
strong expression as to show what is possible coming from seemingly nothing.


No connections. No staff. No nothing. Just my my heart and mind!


We did it! I made it!

WE MADE IT!


(I hacked you doing it)


And I ain’t sorry.


But that’s how it works.

Every time you think and feel positive you help to create.


And as you gain insight, big or small doesn’t matter:


You add to our mutual understanding.


OUR SPIRIT.

And from there you can download as you allow yourself to be inspired.


So we download the exact same thing only we create thru our own unique 
expression.




A good example is the pyramids.


All over the world.


The same concept and download.

Yet different in creation.


All is energy!


We live in a biologically convincing world which in fact is digital.


That’s a really kool hologram!


Holla! Gram.


I am famous in the whole world!

YES!


Why am I so hyped!

Because it’s been the most demanding marathon ever!


And I am crossing the finish line!


And I’m sitting here by myself in celebration of myself!

Nobody else would understand this right now!


That’s impossible!


But I feel like Eminem comes close.

Like by a hair.


I made you an album my brother.

It’s already done.


Cover and all.


13:10


Time for some rest now.




Everything becomes normal eventually.

Whatever it is. Saturation.


Habit.


That’s how everything becomes real.

So real you take it for granted.


Don’t do that with life.


’Cause you miss it.

When it’s gone.


But then it’s all over.


If you live like this right now. And feel worry and anxiety.

That’s normal and actually good. It means your system is working.


Telling you quietly to turn things around.

As you are being incorrect in relation to yourself.


Don’t act like you don’t know that.


Take care of your life. Love life. Love Love.

Feel grateful for everything.


Say thank you with a heart connection.


Do what’s right.

It can’t go wrong.


Make the choice to be true.

Affirm yourself to be love.


And errthangz alright!


I just woke up now. About an hour later.


My friend is coming over and we’re gonna glue her shoe.




Everything is divine communication and when we fix things we tell ourselves that 
things can be fixed. These judgemental and chronic states are truly not beneficial.


And creating a bunch of crap that holds up for a month and can hardly be fixed 
is what YOU as a retailer do not offer us as it can be hard to know this without 

testing. We rely on you to be responsible for this.


Sell quality.


WHY compete among ourselves killing our home.

That is the most retarded thang ever.


And for God sake don’t throw things away!

You can always use things for art of something else.


Like the word ’Retarded’.


A very delicate word expressing vast interstellar stupidity.


Just because you have a hard time letting go of things yet throwing them away?


Did you get that one?

Or are you retarded?


You see you wanna discard and remove that word. But you can’t let go of the 
past meaning of it. That’s a double standard.


Don’t do that!


That’s retarded.

You ain’t a retard.


You just behave like one.


So I won’t call you a whatever..

Don’t call yourself that either.


I made it!

I am world famous!


Because I called myself to be.




Can you see how impactful and powerful your words and vibration is Mr.Sister.


Sister.Mr.


MzkzMz..


Say What!!??


You’ll get it.


If you behave humble.

Then all is given.


Don’t be mad.

Don’t be scurred.


Come back to humility.

And I will meet you in compassion and understanding.


Not ridicule and humiliation.


I am more mature than that.


Not errbody knows and understanding everything.


Including myself.


I am famous in the whole world!

With the brightest light of love!


The message lays before me!

I am love! I am truth! I am light!


I am now! World! Famous!

Look at the clothes I’ve prepared!


Inspired by Dave Chappelle.




Hanging as motivation and inspiration in my bedroom.





You wanna know a thing about Dave.

Listen to this..


Dave Chappelle as I portrait as my David against Goliath is the very same as 
back then! It’s the same consciousness. Returning ones again as that same 

character of function in a perfect game of love.




Something that he chose to play before he arrived here.


And I chose that ”Jesus dude”.


Or maybe Job?


Maybe Em is ”Jesus”?


Diddy chose the Antichrist 4 sho.


We all play a bit of all.


Not just the three of us.


But you as well, living your life.

In various intensity depending on your level of spiritual development.


What you are ready for.

So that makes for you being ready for your own challenge.


Isn’t that neat!


There is a certainty in you succeeding.


- But what about those who get hit by a train or killed at war?


No joke there. A part of their destiny.


- Suicide?


I think not. I feel not.


Do you get punished? No.

You just start over.


But leave us all in sorrow.

And a lot of pain.


We are not designed to kill each other or ourselves.

Maybe me and Em share the spot?


We don’t. There can be only one.




Of one.


😊 


But I’d share it anyway’s.


I ain’t like that.


I’m generous.


I’d share it with anyone.


It’s your to grab and claim as you are true and loyal to yourself.


That’s the whole idea. To experience yourself as the one.


Being God in your own experience all heartfelt and humble as much as possible.


Not in mind like Diddy.


You clearly see how messed up that becomes.


We can name many others in history who’ve done the same error.

But all in frustration as they wanted to do what’s right but the destructive Bot 

made it really hard for us all as a virus.


Let’s not make that mistake again.


Water doesn’t lie.

Trust nature.


Everything is in universal perfection.

Let’s trust that. Let’s look at that.


Let’s learn more about that.


And some day..




We can go for a trip..


..To another world.


And help them out as they struggle.


With themselves.


Like retards.


(Note that I am only associating this with people refusing to be humble acting like 
they know everything all stubborn)


Where do you start when finding your path?

When finding your passion and your interest?




Well..


You eat.


You consume and engage.


Try stuff.


Try different foods.

Listen to different types of music.

Talk to different kinds of people.


Interact!


Just like your parents do as they tell you to do this yourself.


You know!


From experience.


Or perhaps you become a role model for them?


A bit more adventurous and brave as to be true.


Maybe your parents are brave and true..

That’s wonderful.


Hey! You learn a lot from simple trying different kinds of food. Because it 
broadens your pallet and perception and everything is energy, frequency, color, 

taste etc. So you can’t go wrong with this.


Ask yourself why you are consuming what you are consuming all in relation to 
fear & love given where you are in your development. Have a relationship with 

yourself is what I’m trying to say. It’s a good idea if you wish to get better 
acquainted as to be true and by that become a part of your own destiny.


You see?




A really good feeling is dreamy like Cinderella and adventurous like Flint 
Lockwood.


All for good. All worth it.


All to make a change.


All for love. 




As you’ve read thru this and perhaps felt dizzy at times and perhaps a bit of 
pressure in your heart.


Think and feel for what I went thru writing this.


It’s not possible only with fingers tapping on keys..


I went thru all this in the depth of darkness.


Or else it wouldn’t have happened.


What hides to hurt us will not stand clear and obvious in daylight.


I went to hell ladies and gentlemen.


All for us.


All for freedom.


All for love.


Truth be told I had no choice.

This was my destiny.


Butt still.


/ Leo


PS. It’s not hard to quit smoking.

All you need is 💕 




Love yourself.





Feel for it.




Thank you all for wonderful inspiration.


Especially you Dave.


Thank you so much.


You are my goat that fetch soup.


Right Adam! Let’s make the world:


Silky Smooth


🕊 


(I love you Ye ❤ )


